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Nursery -   selfie 

Reception  -   mental health   

Year 1 - previous 

Year 2 -   mindful 

Message from Mrs Fynn  

This week we have been celebrating Children’s Mental 
Health Week. We have had several visitors including the 
NHS Mental Heath Support Teams who lead an assembly 
focussed on all emotions being ok. They are looking  
forward to coming in after half term to work with children in 
classes. 

We also welcomed local charity HARP in to share  
information about the work they do in the local community.  
Our ‘Have a Heart for HARP’ non uniform day donations will 
go directly to the Charity to help them to continue with the 
valuable work they do to support homeless people locally. 

Safer Internet Day also happened this week. As part of our 
computing curriculum we teach e-safety throughout the 
year but we also take advantage of Safer Internet Day to 
highlight the importance of staying safe online and knowing 
what to do if you experience anything that makes you feel 
uncomfortable. If you need any support in setting  
appropriate filters on your child’s devices please do let us 
know and we will be able to send you some links to help 
with this or talk you through it. 

Thank you to all of the Reception parents who joined us for 
lunch this week, I know that the children really enjoyed 
sharing the experience. We are currently in the process of 
arranging dates for parents of other classes to join us. 
When they have been finalised we’ll share them on Dojo. 

WEEK 2 LUNCH MENU – WEEK COMMENCING 12TH FEBRUARY 2024  

 

Monday -  Cheese or Rainbow Pizza served with Seasoned Wedges, Carrot and Cucumber Slices  

followed by Fruit Platter 

Tuesday - Chicken Nuggets or Crispy Dippers served with Croquettes, Peas and Carrots followed by  

Rainbow Jelly and Cream 

Wednesday - Pork or Vegetarian Sausage Roll served with Creamy Mashed Potato and Spaghetti Loops 

followed by Frozen Mousse 

Thursday -  Cheese & Tomato Pasta Bake or Jacket Potato with Beans/Cheese/Tuna served with Crusty 

Bread followed by Flapjack  

Friday - School  Closed - Staff Development Day 



We will be holding our next meeting 

on Thursday 29th February at 7pm! 

Please come along and join us if 

you would like to find out about 

what we do and how you can get 

involved to help raise essential 

funds for our School. 

Reading Awards:  This week Reading Award badges have been presented to: 

 

 

Well done, we are proud of your achievement!   

Reading Award boundaries: Bronze - 50 reads, Silver - 100 reads, Gold - 150 reads, Platinum - 200 reads        

Greece: Ayren (Bronze) Charlie (Bronze) Dhilan (Silver) Isabella (Silver) Ronnie Y (Silver) 

Sweden: Leah (Bronze)     

Brazil: Reggie (Bronze) Isabella (Silver)    

      

      

 



Class Attendance Award: 

The best class for attendance this week was Sweden with 97.7% attendance.  Well done to them! 

Unfortunately, 4 classes did not reach our 96% target.  Our overall attendance was 92.8% 

 

 

Star of the Week: 

 

Explorers: Harry Greece:    Violet Brazil: Phoenix 

England:    Beau Sweden:    Molly Japan:    Freya 

Scotland:    Everly France:    Kajus Kenya:    Max 

Wales:    Scarlett     

Greece -  91.4% Brazil -  88% 

Sweden -  97.7% Japan -  93.7% 

France -  97.3% Kenya -  88.3% 



 

Meet our Safeguarding Team 

Mrs Lucy Fynn 

Designated Safeguarding Lead 

Mrs K Strickland Miss K Ryan Miss M Hoath 

David Turner 

Safeguarding Governor 

Deputy Designated Safeguarding Leads 

Children & Families Hub For members of the 

public: 

 

• If a child or young person is in immediate danger, 

call 999. 

 

• If you're worried that a child is being abused or 

neglected, call the Children and Families Hub on  

0345 603 7627. This phone line is open Monday to 

Thursday 9am to 5:30pm, and Fridays 9am to 

4:30pm. 

 

• Out of hours or bank holidays, call the emergency 

duty team on 0345 606 1212. 

Are you concerned about a child? 

 

 Make a note of your concern including the 

date & time  

 Contact the school and speak to someone in 

our Safeguarding Team, you can also raise 

concerns anonymously by contacting the hub. 

 Always share your concerns  


